
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-15019
 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Trucks

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 10, 2015
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 

7 ea. UNIT PRICE

5,700 GVWR, 4x2, 4-door sport utility-type vehicle, per specifications TOTAL

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED

A. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS

1 ea. *

15,000 GVWR (minimum) 4 door, crew-cab truck with mounted fiberglass utility body, UNIT PRICE  60,963.00  63,939.00 61,730.00 67,903.00 69,617.00

complete, per specifications TOTAL NO BID 60,963.00 NO BID 63,939.00 61,730.00 NO BID 67,903.00 69,617.00

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL  2016 Ford F-550 W5G   

2016 Ford F-450 4x2 w/

fiberglass utility body

Ford F450 Crewcab FX-W46

BFXBUODLS
Ram 4500 DPL/L93 Ram 5500 DPSL93

B. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS  150-180 days  150-180 days 180-210 days 120-150 ARO 120-150 ARO

1 ea. *

9,900 GVWR (minimum) single rear wheel, two wheel drive, extended cab truck with installed UNIT PRICE DID NOT MEET 42,689.00 45,885.00 46,859.00 43,130.00   

service body, complete, per specifications TOTAL SPECIFICATIONS 85,378.00 91,770.00 93,718.00 86,260.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL  2016 Ford F250 X2A

Chev. Silverado 2500 HD 

double cab CC25953

2016 Ford F250 Super Cab

w/service body

Ford F250 Super Cab

XZA (RK1 S5680) (US78C)   

C. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS  120 days 150-180 days 140-165 days 180-210 days   

1 ea.

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short type bed (no fender outside), club, crew-cab UNIT PRICE

pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED

D. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS

8 ea.

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short bed (no outside fenders), extended, club, super UNIT PRICE

cab pickup truck, complete, per specifications TOTAL

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED

E. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS

1 ea.

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside), extended, club UNIT PRICE

super cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED

F. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS

3 ea.

4,600 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short type bed (no fender outside), extended, access, super UNIT PRICE

cab pickup truck, complete, per specifications TOTAL

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED

G. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS

1 ea.

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended, club, UNIT PRICE

super cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED ITEM DELETED

H. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS

1 ea. *
9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended, club, super UNIT PRICE 38,459.00 36,553.00 39,545.00 38,835.00 40,330.00  

cab pickup truck, complete, per specifications TOTAL 38,459.00 36,553.00 39,545.00 38,835.00 40,330.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2015 Chev. CK25753 3/4 4x4 2016 Ford F250 Super Cab X2B

Chev. Silverado 2500 HD

Double (Ext) Cab 4x4 CK25753

2016 F250 Super

Cab 4x4

Ford F250 4x4 Supercab XZB

(RK1 C63LPD)  

I. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 120 days 120 days 140-165 days 180-210 days  

G
ra

p
ev

in
e 

D
E

J,
 L

L
C

2
6
0
1

 W
il

li
am

 D
ta

te

G
ra

p
ev

in
e,

 T
X

 7
6

0
5

1

O
P

T
IO

N
 A

G
ra

p
ev

in
e 

D
E

J,
 L

L
C

2
6
0
1

 W
il

li
am

 D
ta

te

G
ra

p
ev

in
e,

 T
X

 7
6

0
5

1

O
P

T
IO

N
 B

G
u
n
n
 C

h
ev

ro
le

t

1
6
5
5

0
 I

H
 3

5
 N

S
el

m
a,

 T
X

 7
8
1
5
4

G
ra

n
d
e 

T
ru

ck
 C

en
te

r

P
.O

. 
B

o
x
 2

0
1
2
1
0

S
an

 A
n
to

n
io

, 
T

X
 7

8
2
2
0

S
il

sb
ee

 F
o
rd

1
2
1
1

 U
S

 H
w

y
 9

6

S
il

sb
ee

, 
T

X
 7

7
6
5
6

C
al

d
w

el
l 

C
o
u
n
tr

y
 C

h
ev

ro
le

t

P
.O

. 
B

o
x
 2

7

C
al

d
w

el
l,

 T
X

 7
7
8
3
6

C
al

d
w

el
l 

C
o
u
n
tr

y
 C

h
ev

ro
le

t

P
.O

. 
B

o
x
 2

7

C
al

d
w

el
l,

 T
X

 7
7
8
3
6

C
o
w

b
o
y
 C

h
ev

ro
le

t

1
4
1
5

 H
w

y
 9

6
 B

y
p
as

s

S
il

sb
ee

, 
T

X
 7

7
6
5
6

1



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-15019
 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Trucks

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 10, 2015
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY G
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1 ea. *

9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended, club, super UNIT PRICE 41,659.25 39,923.00 42,775.00 42,317.00 43,000.00  

cab pickup truck with mounted 1,300 lb. powered lift gate, complete, per specifications TOTAL 41,659.25 39,923.00 42,775.00 42,317.00 43,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2015 Chev. CK25753 3/4 SWB 4x4 2016 Ford F250 Super Cab X2B

Chev. Silverado 2500 HD

Double (Ext) 4x4 CK25753

2016 F250 Super Cab 

4x4 w/lift gate

Ford F250 4x4 Supercab XZB

(RK1 C63LPD)  

J. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 120 days 120 days 140-165 days 180-210 days  

Net Net Net Net Net Net 2% 2%

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 days 10 days

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Ancira Chevrolet Grapevine DCJ, LLC Demandstar  

Bluebonnet Chrysler Dodge Gunn Chevrolet SAWS Website

Caldwell Country Ford North Park Toyota

Cavendar Chevrolet Red McCombs Dodge

Cowboy Chevrolet Red McCombs Toyota/Ford

Dodge Superstore Silsbee Ford

Grande Ford Tom Benson Chevrolet

Grande Truck Center Toyota of Boerne

2


